
Year 11 – French Learning intentions half term 5 (Studio GCSE) 

What? 

When? 

Why? 

Lesson 1 

Learning intentions  
(what can a student do 
at the end of the lesson) 

Lesson 2 

Learning intentions  
(what can a student do 
at the end of the lesson) 

Lesson 3 

Learning intentions  
(what can a student do 
at the end of the 
lesson) 

Week 1 Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: Role Play 
Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: Photo Card 
Themes 1-5 

Develop and practise 
productive skill of 
Speaking 
Context: General 
Conversation 
Themes 1-5  

Week 2 Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: General 
Conversation 
Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: Role Play 
Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
productive skill of 
Speaking 
Context: Photo Card 
Themes 1-5 

Week 3 Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: Photo Card 
Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
productive skill of Speaking 
Context: General 
Conversation 
Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
productive skill of 
Speaking 
Context: Role Play 
Themes 1-5 

Week 4 Develop and practise 
receptive skills of Listening. 
Context: Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
receptive skills of Reading. 
Context: Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
receptive skills of 
Listening and Reading. 
Context: Themes 1-5 

Week 5 Develop and practise 
receptive skills of Reading. 
Context: Themes 1-5  

Develop and practise 
receptive skills of Listening. 
Context: Themes 1-5 

Develop and practise 
receptive skills of 
Listening and Reading. 
Context: Themes 1-5 
 

 


